Additional Funding Request

DEO01 CSS# 16568 WO# 6833 Asset# NA

Description of . . , . .
P Labor and materials to replace exterior wall pack light that was hit by vehicle.

Repairs

Diagnosis: One of the exterior lights on the OMS building has come detached from the

Initial Work building and is hanging by the power wiring. Looks like the mount came loose from
Order the brick. Need to have light remounted and make sure that it is working properly.

$240

Diagnostic Fee | /| ahor 3 hours @ $80/hr

Additional
Labor Cost to $240
Perform TW Labor 3 hours @ $80/hr
Repairs
$504.74
Additional
Material Cost | | gow Bronze Wallpack - FL2F28022 1 | $478.80 | $478.80
to Perform
Repairs Sales Tax $25.94
Total Cost of $984.74

Repair




TIDEWATER v

ENGINEERS / SCIENTISTS / PROGRAM MANAGERS

WORK ESTIMATE

CSS #: | 16568 | Work Order #: | 6833 |
Company Name: Tidewater, Inc. .
Facility ID: DEOO1
Contractor POC: Adam Colopy
Telephone No: 740-819-6207 Building/Location; (e.g.,

- OMS Building Exterior
E-Mail Address: adam.colopy@tideh20.net Classroom/Room #)

Assigned Technician(s): [John Brown

DESCRIPTION of WORK and EXPLANATION for REPAIRS or REPLACEMENT

Labor and materials to replace exterior wall pack light that was hit by vehicle.

LABOR/MATERIAL
MATERIAL/ LINE ITEM
SUB UNIT |LBR/HR| TOTAL
DOLLAR $80 DOLLAR
ITEM QUANTITY | AMOUNT AMOUNT
Labor 3 $240.00
60W Bronze Wallpack - FL2F28022 1 $478.80 $478.80
Sales Tax $25.94
Diagnostic Labor 3 $240.00
SUB-TOTAL COSTS: Materials Total $504.74( Labor| $480.00

TOTAL $984.74




Adam Colopy

From: Adam Colopy

Sent: Wednesday, January 23, 2019 9:35 AM

To: Adam Colopy

Subject: RE: Dover reserve center light replacement

From: Mike Drew Jr. <mdrewjr@drewinvestmentgroup.com>
Date: January 23, 2019 at 08:06:01 EST

To: John Brown <john.brown@tideh2o.net>

Subject: Re: Dover reserve center light replacement

Yes sir. The base price for a 60W Bronze wallpack is 399.00. And again that will come with a 10year full
replacement warranty, excluding hits from fork lifts obviously hah.

Michael C Drew Jr.
Project Management

Drew Investment Group
2035 Barnhill Orchard Rd.
Morganton, NC 28655

mdrewjr@drewinvestmentqgroup.com
Cell: 843-469-9146
Office: 888-943-3052












