Management, Inc.

Additional Funding Request

VA048 CSS# 23506 WO# 11730 Asset# NA

Description of

7

Labor and materials needed to replace the drawer on the safe in the SIPR Cafe

Repairs
Diagnosis: ) i .
.. FC opened the second drawer on the safe in the SIPR café. When he closed it, the
Initial Work : " )
ord handle was stuck in the down position. Needs repair.
rder

Diagnostic Fee | $450

Additional $ 340
Labor Cost to
Perform

) Labor $85 hrx 4
Repairs

$930
Safe Drawer 1 780.00 | $780.00
Additional Cost - $ $
Service Call 1 $150.00 | $150.00
Total f
otal Cost o $1,720.00

Repair




ADVANCED SECURITY SAFE & LOCK
6318 REISTERSTOWN RD
BALTIMORE, MD 21215

Tel: (410) 764-2001

Tel: (877) 267-6562

Fax: (410) 561-6031

Email: Billing2@ampmlock.com
www.AMPMLOCK.com

Customer Information

Tidewater PM
3761 Attucks Drive
Powell, OH 43065

a
SAFESLOCK

www.ampmlock.com

410-764-2001

Estimate

Date

Estimate #

1/22/2020

29623

Item Description

Qty

Cost

Total

REPAIR Interlock part for repair. Part isnt sold seperatly from
drawer head/side tracks. Part will be removed from a

new drawer head. Our price:
$650.00 x .20%

LABOR Labor to install lock and weld container. One tech 4
hours @ 85 per hour (specialized GSA container tech)

SERVICE CALL Service Call
VA048 (CSS 23506 WO 11730)

DIAGNOSE VA048 GSA container check 01/23/2020

Check GSA container, have it working for now,
interlock on second drawer left side needs to be welded
back and replaced. Someone slammed the container

casuing this issue.

Site address: 1741 E Belt Blvd, Richmond, VA 23224

1 780.00

4 85.00

1 150.00

0.00
1 450.00

780.00

340.00

150.00

0.00
450.00

WE LOOK FORWARD TO ASSISTING YOU!

Advanced Security Safe & Lock's One Year Warranty on recalls only covers parts and
services/labor when the part is provided by Advanced Security Safe & Lock. Service/labor
on parts not provided by Advanced Security Safe & Lock or if the parts have passed the
one year warranty time period are NOT covered under Advanced Security Safe & Lock's

One Year Warranty.

Subtotal

$1,720.00

Sales Tax (0.0%)

$0.00

SIGNATURE:

DATE:

Terms: Non-Refundable 50% deposit and 50% due upon completion

Total

$1,720.00

Woman Owned Small Business
Small Business Enterprise




From: Rick Norris

To: "Hunter A"; John Kieffer

Subject: RE: GSA Container Drawer Head

Date: Wednesday, January 8, 2020 11:50:53 AM
Attachments: image004.png

Hey Hunter, is this Drawer Head Legal or Letter Size? Also is it for Mosler/Diebold or Hamilton ?
Lastly do you want it with or without X10? We have in stock here in MD Qty.2 that are Black, Legal,
For Hamilton, Class 6, NO LOCK Part # DH1041AB which is $658.82 each & we have Qty.1 in stock in
MD that is Black, Legal, For Diebold, Class 6, NO LOCK. Part # MSK9872700BB Cost $658.82 each.

Rick Norris
Sales Representative

Lockmasters, Inc.

12011 Guilford Road, Unit 108
Annapolis Junction, MD 20701
Tel 800-654-0637 Ext 510

RickNorris@Lockmasters.com
www.lockmasters.com

This email and any files transmitted with it contains confidential information and is intended only for
the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by
mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot be guaranteed to be
secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or
incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not accept liability for any errors or
omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-mail transmission.

From: Hunter A [mailto:hunter@ampmlock.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 08, 2020 11:42 AM
To: John Kieffer <JohnKieffer@lockmasters.com>
Cc: Rick Norris <ricknorris@lockmasters.com>
Subject: Re: GSA Container Drawer Head

Awesome, need as soon as possible. Thank you!
Best Regards,
Hunter A
Small Business Enterprise
Women Owned Small Business

OFFICE:
MOBILE:



mailto:ricknorris@lockmasters.com
mailto:hunter@ampmlock.com
mailto:JohnKieffer@lockmasters.com
mailto:RickNorris@Lockmasters.com
http://www.lockmasters.com/
tel:(410)+764+2001
tel:(443)+929+1985
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