CMI

Management, Inc.

Over and Above Estimate
Region: 5

Location: MDO019

CSS #: 15569

Maximo Work Order No.: 9573
Asset #: 2047

Date: 6/13/2019

Original Description:
Follow on work from S&S to bring chiller up and operational.

Repairs Needed:
S&S proposes to come out and install a new display board and control board on the York Chiller.

RS Means Line Buildup and Labor Summary (Data Version 2017, Q4):

Line It I Lab . .
Quantity I:lrLembeeT Description Labor Hours Raie;)l:r Materials | Equipment Total
1 NA Diagnostic Labor 4 100 - - $400.00
Materials
1 NA -- -- 9,535.70 - 9,535.70
(See breakdown attached) »9, 2
-- NA Labor 9 $95.00 -- - $855.00
CMI Coordination and
-- . -- - 320.00
NA Site/Task Oversight 4 »80.00 ?
Credit from balance
- NA - - - - ($1,414.33)

remaing from WO 6433

B NA Credit from PM/Season B B B B ($450.00)
Change over

Estimate Summary:

Labor Hours Labor Cost Mztel;lal Credits Total Cost CE Factor Total Estimate
0s

17 $1,575.00 | $9,535.70 |($1,864.33) $9,246.37 102% $9,431.30




@ SZS MECHANICAL

S&S Mechanical Office # 301-574-1555
Location: SSG Isadore S. Jachman USARC Fax # 301-574-1558
12100 Greenspring Ave seth@sandsmidatlantic.com
Owings Mills MD, 21117 sandsmidatlantic.com

Proposal Submitted to: Adam Colopy
Project: MDO19 6433 Chiller

S&S proposed to come out and investigate chiller:

Diagnostic Total: $400.00

S&S proposes to come out and install a new display board and control board on the York chiller.

Materials: $9,535.70

Micro Board /031 01905 002/ $8047.20
Display Board / $854.40

Tax: $534.10

Shipping: $100.00

Labor: $855.00
1 HVAC Technician/9 Hours/$95.00 rate= $855.00

Full estimated total: $10.790.70

Payments to be made as follows: 15 days upon approved invoice
Respectfully submitted: Brian Davis/Lindsay Ruby Dated: 06/14/19
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11 Re: FW: York chiller

smenon smenon <smenon@hugeecorporation.com>
To lindsay@sandsmidatlantic.com
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Lindsay,

There are 3 bards are in this chiller.

The main Micro board is 031 01905 002 ——-§ 6,706.00
Control Board :— 031 01093000 — S 686.00

LCD DISPLACE, 20 CHARECTER — $ 712.00

Please confirm which one you need.

Call me to discuss

Thank you

S5asi

On Wed, Jun 12, 2019 at 8:29 AM Lindsay Ruby <lindsay@sandsmidatiantic.com> wrote:

Is it possible for you to get a quote for this to me today?

Good Morning,

I'm looking for a display board and main control board for this unit (serial number attached)
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