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From: Joe Bayne

To: Michele Dubois; Vanessa Fernandez

Subject: Fwd: 99th FIS R2 - FAC ID NY023 - AFR CSS#21382 - CMI WO 5655 - NOTICE TO PROCEED
Date: Thursday, October 17, 2019 10:33:48 AM

Attachments: AFRCSS21382.pdf

See below.

This has been approved.

Get Outlook for Android

From: Steve Miller <steve.miller@cmimgmt.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2019 10:31:45 AM

To: Joe Bayne <joe.bayne@cmimgmt.com>

Subject: FW: 99th FIS R2 - FAC ID NY023 - AFR CSS#21382 - CMI WO 5655 - NOTICE TO PROCEED

Steve Miller

PM / 99th - Region 2

5285 Shawnee Road Suite #510
Alexandria,VA 22312
703-738-5305
steve.miller@cmimgmt.com

From: Bacani, Paul D CIV USARMY CENAP (US) <Paul.D.Bacani@usace.army.mil>

Sent: Wednesday, September 18, 2019 2:09 PM

To: Steve Miller <steve.miller@cmimgmt.com>

Cc: Bowling, Mark ] CW3 USARMY 99 RD (USA) <mark.j.bowling4.mil@mail.mil>; Linn, Ryan
G CIV USARMY 99 RSC (US) <ryan.g.linn.civ@mail. mil>

Subject: RE: 99th FIS R2 - FAC ID NY023 - AFR CSS#21382 - CMI WO 5655 - NOTICE TO
PROCEED

Steve. The contracting officer has approved the following additional work to proceed:

Site NY023

CSS # 21382
CMI WO # 5655
Asset # NA

Scope: Repair the roof leak in building 200.

Labor Cost $1,140.00
Equipment costis  $350.00
Total Cost $1,490.00

99th concurrence from RFOS, pending approval from 99th DPW. Negotiations will occur prior to
NTP.



mailto:mdubois@internationalsupportgroup.com

mailto:vanessa.fernandez@cmimgmt.com

https://aka.ms/ghei36



CMI

Management, Inc.

Additional Funding Request

Site: NY023 WO# 5655 CSS# 21382 Asset# NA

Description of Repairs Repair Roof Leak Building 200

Diagnosis: Initial Work Order Roof Leak Building 200

CSS# 21382

Explanat_|0n of Additional Costs Labor and material to temp stop the leak
for Repairs

Additional Labor Cost to

Perform Repairs 6 x $190 = $1140.00

Additional Material Cost to

Perform Repairs »350.00

Total Cost of Repair $1490.00








ACAV SERVICES

September 17, 2019

ESTIMATE 0917191 CSS2182

| Bill To | ShipTo '
[ S R e N S e s S I e e el e R ]
| ‘
| Customer Intemational Support Group | Recipient 99 RSC DPW |
| J Merchant, M Merchan g R Linn |
| Customer ID# NY023 ~ Address Ernie Pyle USARG
| . ' LDG 206
. Address 9050 Pines Blvd Et To?ter? NY ;
; STE 150 | i
i Pembroke Pines FI 33024 | Phone 718 6316188 1
| { |
' Phone 718 790 3562 ;
Payment Due NET 30 Delivery Date September 25, 2019 ‘
' Salesperson Jw ' Shipping Method N/A

PaymentTerms CC | Shipping Terms  N/A
S e T e R ——— — Ty
- Qty. | Item# Description i Unit Price | Line Total |
R e - SR e e

' 1 Building 200 Ft Totten | |
- Room 3009B Possible Roof Leak | |
Inspected Roof and Ceiling possible | |
' Roof failure is causing water to gather | |
- under the foam insulation on the |

_ | - rubber roof, Roof might need
]  replacement. | |

- Recommend trying to temporally stop
' the leaks by applying a rubber |
- waterproofing material too the areas in
- question inside the upper ceiling. | |
Replace damaged ceiling tile. | |

Material  $350.00
| Labor6 hrs x $190.00 | | $1140.00
TOTAL | - $1490.00 |
L I

ACAV Services

11 Snug Cove Lane
Bayville NY 11709
Jacka377@uverizon.net
516 941 6581








CERTIFICATION OF WORK
(To be completed by the Contractor and saved in the Contractor’s CMMS)

FACID/Building: #*%22 f/uy 20 Date of Visit 707 ( (7

Contractor Personne] on Site:

1. J/Q/é’/& & 2.
Work Performed: ﬂ@ﬁﬂ/? | 30@f}_§ Cﬁ‘ST# 2/ {?‘L

Preventive Maintenance -(Annual, Quarterly, Monthly, equipment identification, etc.)
Service Orders -

Esset & Qty Asset Description

k ﬁ@ﬁ/’? 3007 A
L850 floek Fampz
CWen, Fepad

A2 LpsiRe Frper Lot Loy

Sl Llane bnp see prag

L

CERTIFICATION OF WORK

To be signed by the Contractor:

Print Name:@ 'ﬁﬁ\ Date: 2 [/7 /L&

Signed: -

To be signed by Facility Manager:

I certify that the above named individuals representing the Contractor arrived on site and to the
best of my knowledge, completed the stated work listed:
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VR

Paul D. Bacani, AIA, BOCA, RCS

Project Engineer

Contracting Officer Representative

U.S. ARMY CORPS OF ENGINEERS-PHILADELPHIA DISTRICT Construction Branch Central
NJ Resident Engineer Office U.S. Army Corps of Engineers

Tel: (609) 562-2925

Mobile: (609) 508-0037

E-Mail: paul.d.bacani@usace.army.mil





