CMI

Management, Inc.

Additional Funding Request

Site: VA0O09 WO#6473 CSS #16513 Asset# 2260

Description of Repairs Replace Safety Relief Valve

Diagnosis: Initial Work Order Replace Safety Relief Valve to allow for boiler certification

CSS# 16513

Explanat.|0n of Additional Costs Labor and Material to replace pressure relief valve
for Repairs

Additional Labor Cost to

Perform Repairs 6x$120.00- $720.00

Additional Material Cost to

Perform Repairs 212949

Total Cost of Repair $849.49-250.00(CM)= $599.49




MOORE’S

“ SERVICE DIVISION

P.O.Box 119 .« Altavista, VA 24517 « 24 Hour Service: 800.789.7199 . Fax: 888.722.2712 . MooresElectric.com
Pruepaosal
October 30, 2018 Quotes are valid for 30 days.
ISG USARC VAOO9 Contact Name George Grant
3502 Bennett Creek Park Rd., Telephone
Suffolk, VA 23345 Cell Phone 304-663-8670
Email ggrant@internationalsupportgroup.com Fax Number

DESCRIPTION OF EQUIPMENT:

Make: Munchkin
Model: 199M R2
Serial: E17Q21809

DESCRIPTION OF PROBLEM:

Checked in and waited for inspector, inspector came and checked out operation. Noted temperature and pressure relief is
leaking and will need to be replaced to finalize inspection. Will submit quote to replace.

DESCRIPTION OF REPAIRS:

Technician will return to site to replace the temperature and pressure relief valve, flush out air in lines and verify operations.

Note: Parts have a 3 to 5 day leadtime.

MATERIAL, EQUIP OR PARTS Quantity Sell price
Relief Valve 1.00 $ 29.97
Misc. Materials 1.00 $ 25.44
Shipping 1.00 $ 19.08
Truck Fee 1.00 $ 55.00
Material Total $ 129.49
LABOR ITEMIZED Labor
Labor - One Man 6 $ 120.00 $ 720.00
Labor - Second Man 0 $ 120.00 $ -
Labor Total $ 720.00
Thank you for your business. If you have any questions or concerns,
please feel free to contact us via telephone or quotes@mooreselectric.com Materials $ 129.49
Labor $ 720.00
Robert Lowery, Changeout Estimator 434-309-2591 TOTAL $ 849.49
Amy Hockaday, Estimator 434-309-2569 This does not include
James Davis, Estimator 434-309-2568 original call cost.

Adam Barker, Estimator 434-369-3514
Jared Underwood, Estimator 434-306-2446

Approved by:

Standard Terms and Conditions
Payments past 30 days are subject to 1.5% monthly service charge on unpaid balance. Additional charges for payments made through credit cards may apply. Late payments
sent to collections or legal process the purchaser agrees to pay all costs, expenses, and reasonable attorney fees.



g~ <A s 0 CERTIFICATION OF WORK
e completed by the Contractor and saved in the Contractor’s CI»MS)

- FACID/Building:  vAQq9 Date of Visit: 10/29/18____

P.'.__ % Contractor Personnel on Site-

1. Jacob Long 2. Bryan Mayo

- Work Performed: Met with Boiler inspector to tear down and allow for inspection

Preventive Maintenance - Services Completed (Annual, Quarterly, Monthly, equipment
identification, etc.)

- 1. Wo# SOOGHUINEEEN
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1. CSS# 5909
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-—-—-—- Original message —-——--

From: Marvin Slaughter <mslaughter@mooreselectric.com>

Date: 10/30/18 9:45 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: George Grant <ggranti@internationalsupportgroup.com>

Subject: FW: International Support Group - VAQDS | Unit #2 | Proposal

George —

Please see the attached valve photo.

| [tem ! Description

|{1uantit\r

! Met Price

um

! Total

i‘.‘.’I‘-ﬂBﬁI\-ﬂﬂiﬂF | *NP 3/4 BRZ MXF BLR PR. VL'V 30 PSI

2|

23.562 |EA

47

Thanks,
Marvin Slaughter
Service Estimator

0. 434.369.3514 | mooreselectric.com

MOORE'S | sx:.

k ‘ ELECTRICAL & MECHANICAL | |MPACT.
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