CMI

Management, Inc.

Additional Funding Request

Site: VA048 WO# 9015 CSS # 19436 Asset#t NA
Description of Repairs PM OWS

Diagnosis: Initial Work Order

CSS# 19436 PM OWS

Explanat_lon of Additional Costs Labor and material to PM OWS

for Repairs

Additional Labor Cost to

Perform Repairs $1,784.00

Additional Material Cost to
Perform Repairs

Total Cost of Repair $1,784.00




From: Troy Craig

To: Jamie Merchant; Mike Merchan

Subject: Fwd: Safety-Kleen VA048 separator quote
Date: Wednesday, June 26, 2019 2:54:34 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Here is the quote from safety-kleen.

Its based on volume of the unit and does not include sludge/solids in separator.

Sent from my T-Mobile 4G LTE Device

———————— Original message --------

From: "Goldin, Katy" <kathryn.goldin@safety-kleen.com>
Date: 6/26/19 2:43 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: Troy Craig <tcraig@internationalsupportgroup.com>
Cc: George Grant <ggrant@internationalsupportgroup.com>
Subject: RE: Safety-Kleen

Here is a rough quote for the service not including any solids

SERVICE PRICE
VAC HOURLY $304

VAC SOLIDS AND LIQUIDS $1480
TOTAL $1784

Katy Goldin Inside Sales Representative | Safety-Kleen | A Clean Harbors Company |
kathryn.goldin@safety-kleen.com | (0) 972.265.2859 - ask for Katy Goldin | safety-kleen.com

safetyhIeen i zeces v

Safety Starts with Me! Live it 3-6-5

From: Troy Craig [mailto:tcraig@internationalsupportgroup.com]
Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2019 12:58 PM

To: Goldin, Katy <kathryn.goldin@safety-kleen.com>

Cc: George Grant <ggrant@internationalsupportgroup.com>
Subject: Re: Safety-Kleen

Yes, it's 23224.

Thanks,
Troy Craig
ISG
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